45-04NOV24
Tires: Large Trucks and Heavy Equipment
Term Supply

Category 1 — Medium Truck Tires — Radial, Ply

GoodYear Tire and Rubber Company

Pomp's Tire Service

McKnight Tire - Bid #1

McKnight Tire - Bid #2

Item # Size Ply Rating Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each)
48.1. :I::ﬁr/lgo R19.5 12PR  |GY G G647 RSS 139172053 $292.98 F/S FS561 F248409 $290.00 Arison AS673 THO6555 $178.95 Pirelli RO2 Steer 6008400 $252.63
4.8.1. b.225/70 R19.5 " .
Drive 12PR GY G G622 RSD 139755205 $297.65 F/S TRANSFORCE AT2 F004195 $290.00 Arison AD778 THO06548 $183.95 Pirelli RO2 Drive 6008500 $258.42
4.8.2. a.11-R22.5 .
Steering * 16PR GY Workhorse MSA 138799689 $373.48 F/S FS 560+ F156558 $350.00 Arison AZ682 TH21022 $326.44 Pirelli FG85 2849500 $347.60
4.8.2. b.11-R22.5 Arison AL373 TH39904 "
Drive 16PR GY H Workhorse MSD 138835691 $398.47 F/S FD 663 F211206 $355.00 Arison AL972 TH16103 $330.95 Pirelli TG85 2849600 $352.60
48.2. gi\}e-izezc;ip 16PR GY PCT G167 22 254086702 $151.50 Z/?? BANDAG MAXTREAD 388DR4 $185.00 Bandag BDL 388BDL $184.25 Bandag BDL 388BDL $184.25
4.8.3. 315/80 R22.5 .
Steering * 20PR GY L Workhorse MSA 756141689 $483.73 F/S FS860 F244465 $498.83 Arison AZ682 TH21008 $442.95 Pirelli MG89 3840100 $547.52
4.8.4. 215/75 R17.5 HTR 16 PR |GYH G114 LP STTL 756246567 $253.43 ACTN AP580 A121359-1176 $180.00 Arison AS673 TH96150 $179.95 Pirelli STO1 2527800 $233.93
4.8.5. 235/75 R17.5 .
HTR 16 PR |GY H Endurance RSA 139009674 $301.82 ACTN AP580 A12135-93176 $199.33 Arison AS673 TH96136 $214.95 Pirelli STO1 2527900 $270.59
4.8.6. CATEGORY 1 TOTAL $2,553.06 CATEGORY 1 TOTAL $2,348.16 CATEGORY 1 TOTAL $2,042.39 CATEGORY 1 TOTAL $2,447.54
*On/Off Road Compound
gory 2 — - | i i .
Catg ory 2 e, Off-Road, Radial, Construction GoodYear Tire and Rubber Company Pomp's Tire Service McKnight Tire - Bid #1 McKnight Tire - Bid #2
Equipment
Item # Size Ply Rating Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each)
4.8.7. 17.5-R25 One * (New) GY 1X GP2B 6S 152524070 $1,870.40 (Al\;’ew) FIS VERSABUILT F005498 $1,410.00 (New) Westlake WR03 TH15229 $953.95 (New) Westlake WR03 TH15229 $953.95
. BOONE COUNTY (Recap SnowPlusTread) (Recap SnowPlusTread)
4.8.8. 17.5-R25 One (Recap SnowPlusTread) No Bid No Bid (Recap SnowPlusTread) HWY 10 $1,186.00 Unicure CSG CsG $1,075.00 Unicure CSG CsG $1,075.00
XHA - FIS VERSABUILT
4.8.9. 20.5-R25 12 XHA - GY 1X GP2B 6S 155903276 $2,154.40 AT F005508 $4,067.50 XHA - Westlake WR03 TH15236 $1,227.95 XHA - Westlake WR03 TH15236 $1,227.95
4.8.10. CATEGORY 2 TOTAL $4,024.80 CATEGORY 2 TOTAL $6,663.50 CATEGORY 2 TOTAL $3,256.90 CATEGORY 2 TOTAL $3,256.90
L N T N S P B GoodYear Tire and Rubber Company Pomp's Tire Service McKnight Tire - Bid #1 McKnight Tire - Bid #2
Item # Size R;Ii);]g Tire Code Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each)
4.8.11. [19.5.-24 10 R-4 GY 1X GP2B 6S 155903276 $850.40 Galaxy Easy Rider R4 200439 $520.68 Maxam MS904 V60302 $539.95 Maxam MS904 V60302 $539.95
4.8.12. 400/80 R24 149A8 [TRI2 NO BID NB Alliance 550 Multi 55001700 $1,098.62 Alliance 550 55001710 $1,006.50 Alliance 550 55001710 $1,056.50
4.8.13.  |480/80 R34 164A8 [TRI2 NO BID NB Alliance 550 Multi 55003310AL $1,630.58 Alliance 550 55003310 $1,642.95 Alliance 550 55003310 $1,642.95
4.8.14.  |460/70 R24 TR12 NO BID NB Alliance 1598 5500120 $1,102.99 Maxam MS909R 80103 $769.95 Maxam MS909R 80103 $769.95
4.8.15. CATEGORY 3 TOTAL $850.40 CATEGORY 3 TOTAL $4,352.87 CATEGORY 3 TOTAL $3,959.35 CATEGORY 3 TOTAL $4,009.35

Category 4 — Skid Steer/Mini Excavator Tracks

GoodYear Tire and Rubber Company

Pomp's Tire Service

McKnight Tire - Bid #1

McKnight Tire - Bid #2

Item # Size Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each) Type & Brand Stock No. Price (each)
4.8.16. 450-81-76 NO BID NB Arison Block Pattern P17450N76 $2,009.00 Camso SD Narrow 15.1870.7028 $2,714.00 Camso SD Narrow 15.1870.7028 $2,714.00
4.8.17. |450-81-78 NO BID NB Arison Block Pattern P17450N78 $2,009.00 Camso HDX Narrow 15.2806.8789 $3,162.00 Camso HDX Narrow 15.2806.8789 $3,162.00
4.8.18. |400-72.5-74 NO BID NB Arison V-Lug P17400N74 $1,519.00 Bridgestone Tri Tech CMT 3400 $1,923.00 Bridgestone Tri Tech CMT 3400 $1,923.00
4.8.19. [450-100-48 NO BID NB Arison Block Pattern P1745TB48 $1,465.00 Camso SD 16.3092.9110 $2,092.00 Camso SD 16.3092.9110 $2,092.00
4.8.20. [400-86-56 NO BID NB Arison Block Pattern P1740BB56 $1,375.00 Bridgestone KF Block CMT 2130 $1,679.00 Bridgestone KF Block CMT 2130 $1,679.00

CATEGORY 4 TOTAL $0.00 CATEGORY 4 TOTAL $8,377.00 CATEGORY 4 TOTAL $11,570.00 CATEGORY 4 TOTAL $11,570.00

4.8.21.




45-04NOV24

Tires: Large Trucks and Heavy Equipment

Term Supply

Category 5 — Additional Tire Related Services

GoodYear Tire and Rubber Company

Pomp's Tire Service

McKnight Tire - Bid #1

McKnight Tire - Bid #2

Item # Description Price Price: Price Price:
4.8.22. Tire Repair — In Shop (each) $50.00 $28.00 $37.50 $37.50
4.8.23. Balancing of Tire (each) $40.00 $28.00 $30.00 $30.00
4.8.24. Alignment — Front axle NB $83.00 $130.00 $130.00
4.8.25. Alignment —Two/Three axle (Tandem/Single trucks) NB $83.00 $130.00 $130.00
4.8.26. Service Calls in County normal business hours (per hour) $125.00 $95.00 $115.00 $115.00
4.8.27. :;mz;g:f:;g;?: oi;’:;;yu?er, i?uer;gency Alfter-hours, $200.00 $105.00 $310.00 $310.00
4.8.28. Service Calls in the County (per mile) $0.00 $0.00 $0.30 $0.30
4.8.29. Flat Shop Rate (per hour) $125.00 $70.00 $160.00 $160.00
4.8.30. Mounting and Dismounting (Medium Truck Tires) $40.00 $28.00 $32.50 $32.50
4.8.31. Mounting and Dismounting Dry Tires (per cross-section inch) NB $4.00 $6.00 $6.00
4.8.32. Mounting and Dismounting Tires with Fluid (per cross-section inch) NB $5.00 $8.00 $8.00

Alternate liquid material for weight fills on tractor tires - non-corrosive,
4833 | aimimaghesum. lomperaure e ess toan 3 degrees . No ne 242 $450 $as0
Methanol accepted.
4.8.34. Tire Disposal — Categories 1 (per tire) $10.00 $8.00 $12.00 $12.00
4.8.35. |Tire Disposal — Category 2 and 3 (per tire) $30.00 $17.00 $30.00 $30.00
4.8.36. Track Disposal — Category 4 (per track) NB $25.00 $75.00 $75.00
4.8.37. Valve Stems (each) $6.00 $4.00 $8.00 $8.00
4.8.38. |Tire Fee Per Senate Bill 225 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50
4.8.39. CATEGORY 5 TOTAL $626.50 $585.92 $1,089.30 $1,089.30
4.8.40. GRAND TOTAL: $8,054.76 $22,327.45 $21,917.94 $22,373.09
4.10. Renewals:
1 3.5% 10.0% 5.0% 5.0%
2 3.5% 10.0% 5.0% 5.0%
3 3.5% 10.0% 5.0% 5.0%
4 3.5% 10.0% 5.0% 5.0%

sign

date




